
 

 

Name of the wish child: Umesh Anjan Kumar 

   

Age: 5 years 

Gender: Male 

Resident of: Machilipattinam,  
Andhra Pradesh 

Referring 
Hospital: 

Adyar Cancer 
Institute 

Date of 
Identification: 

26.8.15 

Date of 
Fulfilment: 

19.09.15 

Wish Volunteer: Sasikala/ 
Neda 

Wish gift: Cycle  

Wish Story: Wish Photograph: 

 
Umesh, 5 year old boy is from a 
remote village of Andhra Pradesh. 
He is suffering from a life 
threatening illness and undergoing 
treatment for the same in Adyar 
Cancer Institute. His family has 
temporarily rented a room near to 
the hospital. 
 
He is a very brave and smart wish 
child. At a very young age he has 
planned for his career. “When I 
grow old I want to become a Judge 
and give punishment to all sinners” 
says Umesh.  
 
When the volunteers of Make A 
Wish Foundation of India met this 
child in the hospital, he was very 
happy to make a conversation with 
them. He told the volunteers about 
his best friends in school, his 
favourite game, and his favourite 
subject etc. He also mentioned that 
all his friends have a cycle and 
only he doesn’t have a cycle. “I feel 
left out when I see my friends 
riding cycle. I wish I too had a 

 
 

 



 

 

 

 

cycle to join them” says Umesh. 
 
When the volunteers asked him 
about his most cherished wish, he 
promptly replied that, he wishes to 
have a cycle. Which the volunteers 
already had known during the chat 
with him.   
 
With the help of our donor PPN 
Power Generating Pvt Ltd, we were 
able to fulfil his wish to have cycle. 
So, Make-A-Wish Foundation® of 
India thought of elating the little 
kid by gifting him with other 
games as an enhancement. He was 
more than happy to receive the 
cycle, he immediately sat on the 
cycle and he joyfully posed for a 
picture with a cheerful grin on his 
face. 


